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 The programme started with floral welcome of the Guest Speaker by Ms 
A. M. Badar, Co-ordinator of ED Cell. The proceedings of the 
programme were conducted by Ms. Kalyani Gawande. Dr. Sumant 
Tekade, a noted motivational speaker, delivered a lecture on 
“Development of Youth Personality for Social Responsibility”. Dr. 
Tekade earned his MBA degree from Bengaluru University and has 
extensive experience as HR manager with Wipro IT Company. He has a 
rich experience of recruitment as he has interviewed more than thousand 
IT professionals. Due to passion for service to the society he plunged into 
social service. In today’s world social responsibility has become 
increasingly important. He explained how a student can play an important 
role in improving and strengthening the society. He emphasized the need 
to take the steps for removing social evils based on the steps taken by 
Chhatrapati Shivaji Maharaj. Dr. Tekade also stressed the need for 
protecting the public property. He told the students to maintain 
cleanliness in public places similar to the way we keep our own house 
clean. He asked the students to lead a disciplined life by following rules 
and regulations. He also elaborated the importance of controlling ego and 
anger, remaining alert, hard working nature, helping the needy and older 
people, donating clothes to less fortunate, respecting women etc. He 
appealed the students to help less privileged students in their studies.  
He explained the importance of setting goals for future career. He told the 
students that they should strive hard to achieve their life mission not only 
for themselves but also for the society. The students were highly 
motivated by the speech given by Dr. Tekade. The programme was 
largely attended and ended with vote of thanks by Ms. Janhavi Burbure.  
 

 

 



   

HoD Mr R. V. Patil welcoming the guest speaker.          Mrs. A. M. Badar giving vote of thanks 

 

   

    Dr. Sumant Tekade delivering the lecture.                       Students engrossed in the lecture   


